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ABSTRACT 
 

Every paper should include an abstract with 150-300 words. 
At the end of the abstract, skip a line and then type 
"Keywords:" (bold and followed by a colon) followed by up to 
five (5) words that describe the focus and contribution of the 
paper.  
 
Keywords: knowledge, system science  
 
 

1. TITLE OF THE PAPER 
 

The title of the paper should be writen in bold in 12 point font, 
centered on the top of the paper. The first letter of every word 
in the title should be capitalized. The authors name’ must be  
in bold in 9 point font, followed the title with a line space 
skipped. The affiliation should followed the authors name, in 9 
font. 
 
 

2. HEADINGS 
 

Headings are numbered and capitalized. All major headings 
are centered in bold in 9 font. Do not put a period after the text 
of the heading. Leave two lines above a major heading, and 
one line clear below before the start of the next paragraph or 
second-level heading.  
 
2.1 Subheadings (Second-Level Heading) 
 
Subheadings are flush left, in 9 point type and bold and upper 
and lower (title) case as shown. There should be one line space 
before and one line space after this level of heading, as shown 
in the subheading for this paragraph. 
 
 

3.    BODY OF THE PAPER 
 
The whole paper should be written in “Times New Roman” 
font. Except the title of the paper which is in 12 font size, the 
whole paper should be written in 9 font. Every graph should 
be justified. The line spacing should be single line. And please 
leave one line space between two paragraphs. Every paper 
should be limited to 6 pages. 
 
Except the title, authors’ name and affiliation, the whole paper 
should be two-columned. The width of each column should be 
8cm, the space between the two columns should be 1cm.     
 
Please set the paper size as A4. Leave 3.4cm margins at the 
top and 3.6cm at the bottom of the page, 2cm on both right 
and left sides. Please write your paper using Word. The Word 

of microsoft’s office 2000 is strongly prefered. If you write the 
paper by using other versions’ Word, please give clear 
indication of  what version of Word you use when you submit 
the paper by email. 
 
 

REFERENCES 
 
[1]. References must be numbered, according to the order 

they cited in the paper.  
[2]. References should be identified in the text of the paper 

by typing the corresponding number in [ ]. 
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